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On the morning of January 12. 2015, I traveled from the Springf1eld, VA tn;:tro stop to [/Enfant 
Plaza where I was scheduled to teach a class all week. I boarded a train in Springfield rill 7:05am 
and <~rrived <~! L'Enfant Pla;;:a CiiJ 7:50am. At@ 3:10pm, I re-entered the L'Entant Plaz~ station 
f(H my return trip. I swiped my registered SmarT rip card each way. For my trip home. 1 wa:; 
hoping to catch the Yellow Line "Rush Plus" train, which travels all the way back to Springfield. 
However, when I did not see on the train arrival board that a Yellow "Rush Plus" train was due 
to arrive soon. I decided to catch the regular Yellow Line train when it arrived. My plan was to 
travel one stop to the Pentagon, exit that train. and cat~h a Blue Line from there--an option that 1 
had taken many times before. Unfortunately, the Yellow Line train that I boarded at L'Enfant 
Plaza that day was the ill-fated train that on which one woman lost her life and dozens of other 
riders, induding me, sutTcred physical and psychological injury. 

I boarded the six-car Yellow Line train. I never count the cars as a train reaches the platform, so 1 
am not certain which car I boarded. But based on how close I was to the back of the train when! 
was evacuated, I bdiew I must have hoarded the fourth car. I sat very near the door. I sat on the 
lirst row beside the handicapped scats that were across from the door where I had entered the car. 
A Stlllknt who had atknded my dass sat very near me in one of' the seat~ reserved filr 
bandicapp~d passengers. An evacuation poster was on the wall h~side me. I remember looking 
desperately to it f(ll' guidance wh.:n it became apparent that our situation was serious, but it 
otfered no assistance for the probkm we w~re experiencing. While 1! noted instructions lor 
.:xiting a mctrorail train during ;111 emergency--even while inside the tunneJ-,we were told 
repeatedly not to open the doors because the train could not move back to the platf.orm if the 
doors w~rc opl!n, 

The train pullt~d away from the platform. and all seemed normal. But a couple hundred yards 
inside· the tunnel, the train stopped. Still, this is not unusual. Ordinarily, when the train stops, the 
train operator will announce the reason why. such as there is a train servici11g the platform ahead 
of us. und we will be moving momentarily. But on Jammry 12, no announcement was made for a 
very long time. Alter a while. passengers, including me, started asking each other, "I wonder 
what's going on?" Smoke started entering the car. A passenger very near me asked, "Is that 
smoke')" Sevcml people responded "Yes!" almost in unison. Then there was a flurry of activity 
and (I harrage or other question~·~· mostly. "Is the train on tire?" 

At this point, thcr~ still had not been an announct:ment from the train operator as to exactly what 
was happening. 'fhcr~ was a lot of discussion about what we would do if it was a fire. As the 
smok~: continu~:d to seep into the car. some people around me began to cough. l took a picture on 
my phone. Finally an announcement came (presumably fJ'Om the train operator) but with no re<~l 
detail~ about what was happening. We were not told much more than there was a problem. and 
we were: going to try to move back to the platl~mn. lie said nothing about whether or not there 
was a lire anywhere. ;\ few minutes after that, the train did move backward a tew feet but then 
stopped again abruptly. The a1111ouncer then inf~mned us that there was another train on the 
plaH(mn. and he needed to get it moved so that we could move back. lie told us al~o not to panic 
and not to open the doors because the train couldn't nJovc if the doors were open. 

(j) 
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Shortly ther~~aHer, someon~ (again, I believe it was the train operator), walked hurriedly by 
without saymg a word. A few mmut~s later, there was another announcement He said again that 
he was try1ng to get th~ other tram moved away from the platform so that we could move hack. 
llo.C then sc~.:mcd.to be talking to someont: connected to metro and could be heard directing them 
to tell SOIJJeone 1n the stat1on to get the other train off the platf(mn because he needed to mow 
Our train back to it 

By this time, more .and m~m~ smoke was tilling the car rmd people were really beginning to panic 
and >!low M::nous stgns ot what appeared to be respiratory distress: people were coughing 
secmmgly uncontrollahly; some were lying on the flom trying to get down as low as possible 
under the smoke; one man was lying on the tloor near the door complaining that he had a~thma 
and eNddn't hreath.::; nnd a young man sitting on the floor right beside my seat became 
hystericaL and Sl'Ventl passengers seated nearby tried to calm him. He was upsetting me. 1 can 
remember thinki11g how much he was acting more like a ~poiled child than a frightened adult. 
Even in that situation, his conduct was extreme. In fact, one man who was lying on the J1oor 
already even threatened to kick his legs out from under him if he didn't sit down on the floor like 
people were telling him. 

Many of us cuvercd our mouths and no~es with Nil' hands, our arms acro~s the face, clothing, 
scarws. tissue--anything we could use that might keep us from inhaling the smoke. Some had 
handkerchiefs or bandannas that they poured water on and then held them over their nose and 
mouth. I searched frantically through my bag fi:rr the surgical masks that l always carry with me 
when I trovd \ll' teach bcc11use I have a very st:rious allergy to bananas--even to their smell. 
When I couldn't. find them, I started to panic. After a while, I rtlmembered that I had forgotten to 
transfer the masks when I had switched out bags over the weekend_ Thankfully, I had on a mock 
turtlen~<:k shirt that day. and I thought to pull the collar up over my m(Juth and nose. I hadn't 
worn that shirt in three year~ and had made a last minute decision to wear i1 that day only 
bccaus~: it m<~tchcd th~ pinstripes in my suit perfectly. Talk about Divine intervention! With that 
probkm solved, I was able to calm down a little and then tried to fig~1re out what I could do to 
~avi' my~el L l.'ven at that pnint. it didn't s~~m as if help, direction, or information, was going to 
come from anyone at metro. 

At 3:38, I dialed 91 L but I couldn't get a connection. I stared at the evacuation poster searching 
for an answ<;:r, but it offered none for our situation. Several of the men around me started talking 
about us needing to come up with our own ~vacuation plan because it didn't seem like anyonl' 
was going to rescue us. l'hey asked questions like, "What are we going to do? Are we just going 
to sit. here and die')" The discussion turned to whether or not we should just pry the doors open, 
gd oil the tri1.in. and try to lind our own way back to the platform. I ~poke up and said I didn't 
think that was a good idea because no one really knew enough about that electrified third raiL I 
said that the >moke seemed to be coming from the tunnel, so it had to be worse out ther~ than it 
wa~ on the train. Finally I said that I felt our chances were better if we stayed on the train. The 
discussion continued for a while and the men examined the door to see how to pry it ()pen. but no 
one anemptcd it right then. 

i\t ~nrne pnint atler thnt the train operator rushed past us again beaded back toward the front of 
th~ train. Another announcement came telling us not to panic and not to open the doors because 
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the t~a~n couldn't move if!h~ doors w~::re open. But as more and more time elapsed and 
eoml!tJons ':"-orsened. ~:e necame more desperate and more convinced that we were not going to 
survive. I tncd to rem tun calm. I am not prone to hysteria; my normal disposition is nne of calm 
and rcscrw. But nn that day. dc:spite my outward calm, I was horrified. Nrver had I been in a 
situation where l was aware that I might actually die. But I tried to stay calm and think of 
somt:thing. anything. I could do. I couldn't call out for help, and there wasn't any guidance or 
information coming from anyone on the inside except to tell us not to panic not to open the 
doors. I kept listening lbr an answer that never came. Then the train operator caml' n1shing 
through th.: ~ar again headed for the back of the train a second time, but he said nothing! 

Finally. a group of men in my car took matters into their own hands--they forced the door open. 
I'hen a gruup of four <Jr Jiv(; peopk, including the hysterical boy, stood there contemplating 
;;xactly what they should do when they got into the tunnel. Smoke came billowing in. I yelled out 
to the group to just go if they were going to leave, and close the door! ·rhcsc were th~ same 
people reported in the news as having sclt:evacuatl!d. They exit~d the train, but not before 
making nur had situation worse. The smoke became even more unbearable. People were 
<.:oughing badly. Some started crying. The air quality was so bad that we had to evacuate our car 
and move to the next C<U behind us. So now. not only were we not able to breathe, but we were 
packed tightly together. 

There was more punic. One woman complained that she felt like she was going to pass out. She 
kept saying she was really hot. A woman sitting beside her was fanning her and then helped her 
n:movc her shirt. A small group. including me, joined hands and prayed. Still, there was no 
commun icalinn. 

At some P\Jit1l. a lire Jlghtcr appeared in that c;1r. But still, there was no communication or 
direction. I tugged at his arm and asked if we should follow him. I asked if he was tlm·e to 
evacume us. hut he didn't respond. Suddenly, we heard a voice yelling, "Coming through! 
Coming through! Sick person!" livcryone cleared the aisle. A group of people came through 
(:arrying a man by his feet and shoulder~. His body was convulsing. They took him through to 
the next car. fhal was as liu as I could se~. A minute or two later, a similar call rang out, and 
another group of peopk brought someone else through the same way-shoulders and feet. When 
they passed hy me, I couldn't see the person's lace, but I could tell that it was a woman's body. I 
wondered Iuter i r that was the woman who died, Then a couple of people came by escorting the 
woman who had taken off her shirt. They had put a jacket around her shoulders to cover her. l 
just sut and wa!chcd in horror not knowing what would be my lltte. 

A short while later. II retighten appeared and began telling us to form a single line. Fi11ally we 
were heing rescued! One hy one. we had to he helped down off the train. [I was quite a jump 
down especially tbr nw; I was w~aring a l 0 pound backpack that contained my hooks f'i:Jr the 
chts> I had taught. Then came the long walk, without any assistance at all, hack to the station. 
lhc tunnel was barely lit. and the smoke was thick. When I arrived at the station, l asked a metro 
employee where we were oupposed to go ll·om tlwre. I was told that there would be a shuttle bus 
outside waitiug to tnk~ us to another ~tution so that we could make our conncctiom home. There 
wasn't. 

(3) 
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Neith<!r was thcr~ anyone to provide information once I exited the ~tation. One person pointed to 
a bus m the corner. I walked down there. hut that wasn't the shuttle bus. It was raining and there 
w~.:rc no shuttle busc~. no shelter to stand under, and no information. When a man approacheJ 
who appean~d to he a metro oftlcial, I asked him about the shuttle bus, and his response was that 
he had just arrived and he didn't know anything. When another bus arrived and was just sitting, 1 
..:limbed on to get out oft he rain. But then I was told that the bus was being used for triage only. 
so I had to gel off unless I wanted to get medical treatment: it was going to transport people to 
th.: hospital. I dcclin~d medical tr~atment because_ bv that time, I had lost confidence in the D.C. 
~}stem. I cmild think only about getting home as qui~kly as possible. 

I cnd~id up huving to walk about six or seven blocks in the rain to get to a shuttle bus. Then we 
were grouped <u:cording to our de:;tination. And I waited and waited in the rain. When the bus 
wa~ alwut Jil'~ blocks from the metro station where we were told we would be taken. tlw driwr 
announced th<1t everyone for that station would have to get of1' there. So I had to walk the rest of 
the way in the rain. I didn't have an umbrella--only a hood on my lightweight coat. 

!\ kind woman 1lll the train ride home gave me some wet wipes to clean my hands; they were 
covered with soot. Sh~ also gaw me a couple of throat lo?.enge~. M.y throat was feeling sore and 
l was wughing. More than fom hours after lenving work. J nrrivcd home. I blew tny nose. and 
tht: tissue was tldl of soot. I was startled becuuse I had covered my nose covered the whole time I 
wa~ on the train. When .1 removed my shirt and looked at it. 1 discmered that the collar was 
saturated inside and out with soot. At best, the collar had only served as a slight t11ter; it did not 
k..:cp n~e l"rom inhaling the soot cntirdy. I never washed it. I still have it stored in a bag. 

I sent an e-mail to my own doctor describing my experience and my symptoms and seeking 
medical advice. Another imtrllc!(Jt hod to teach my clas:; the next day. I was not physi<.:ally or 
emotionally able to go ((\ work the next day. That was only the second time in the six years that 
I've hee11 teaching for the (iraduate School USA that I've had to miss a class. And missing a clasR 
means not getting paid. 

Bmllost a lot more than money that day; I lost peace of mind. Here it is nearly eight months 
latt'r and none nl'the detuils ofthat harrowing experience have faded from my memory. Ewry 
time I talk ubout that day ot· see some new~ broadcast about it. emotionally. I find myself right 
back there again. The fear and anxiety .l felt that day come tlooding back. Even writing this 
statement has taken me three days because I had to take frequent breaks from it when the 
memnrks hecnme too owrwhdming. It is for this reason. as well as hearing mischaractcrizations ,,f events and w.:ts of gross negligence that were reve<1led in the WMATA testimony, that I was 
not to be able to attend the second day of the June hearings. But if this statement of my account 
of events is at alluse!\Jl in helping bring about safety changes in the WMATA system. it would 
lmv~ b~cn wdl worth IllY dic:comfort writing it. 

Respectfully submitted. 




