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Aircraft destroyed with post landing impact with sand bunker and green on golf course. No Damage to other property.
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After first starting aircraft at approximately 10:25, run-up and awaiting three other aircraft to take off and one to land, at Clermont County airport, we departed
runway 22. This would have been at approximately 10:35 or shortly after. The winds were very light. We climbed to an altitude of approximately 2,100' MSL
when the engine completely shut down. There was no warning or indication of any issues. I had already seen the golf course and had it in mind in case
something were to happen (standard practice for me to always know where is my next safety zone). I made a turn towards it slight to get a better look and
clear the area for people on the ground. At the same time I started best glide speed and cockpit checks of fuel on, switched to secondary ignition and fuel
pump and tried to crank the engine again. It would crank but there was no indication it would start again. I also made an emergency call in the blind to
Clermont Country airport and heard that it was relayed twice from different aircraft to the FBO. While circling to make the best possible approach to the
fairway of choice (it was clear of people, power lines but lined with tall trees from all angles), I attempted restart three more times between the primary and
secondary ignition/fuel pumps with no luck. I answered one more radio call letting them know I was going to be landing on a golf course southwest of the
airport. I was able to clear all trees and land on the fairway in a normal landing configuration, with full flaps in a tail low three point landing setup, and at a
normal approach and landing speed for this aircraft. I landed about 1/2 way down the fairway and was rolling out when my right tire went across a slight
bump (upwards undulation) in the fairway, a moment later my left wheel and wing tip contacted the ground, then the stopped prop blade that was in the
lowest position and cowling struck the ground. The left wing tip impact was very slight, but combined with the left tire hitting the rough grass and hill in front of
a sand bunker, the aircraft swung approximately 70 to 80 degrees left of previous ground track. As the aircraft was thrown back into the air by the hill in front
of the sand bunker and then started to settle back down, the right tire contacted the surface of the green and rolled the aircraft onto the right wing, horizontal
stabilizer and ultimately came to rest in a slightly right side down position. Wreckage was all contained to within about 40 feet of the aircraft, starting with
mostly paint and fiberglass pieces from the lower cowling from impacting the steep hill prior to the sand bunker and green where the aircraft came to rest.
Most pieces were still intact with the aircraft, other than the lowest propeller blade and the right wing flaperon.

There was no other suitable landing terrain within gliding distance. The area is completely covered with trees, rolling hills, homes and power lines. Even
roads were not suitable as use for landing areas, as the only road I could see straight enough was fairly heavily congested at the time the engine quit.

We required no services at I69 airport.

I do not see how this accident could have been prevented. The engine had just been checked over four hours of flight time previous to it shutting down.
Everything was in normal operating condition. It ran perfectly and started normally twice the morning of the accident with no hesitation or issues. Everything
was checked that could have been for safety of flight. I believe my actions were in accordance with all my training to minimize damage to aircraft, property
and the lives of anyone else on the ground. Furthermore I think that the outcome of no injuries, indicates that my actions were correct given the
circumstances.
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